LIBERTYVILLE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 12-0-05

AN ORDINANCE REPLACING ORDINANCE NOS.09-0-02, 05-0-04 AND (1-0-01
ADOPTING FIRE PREVENTION CODE

Adopted by the
Board of Trustees
of the
Libertyville Fire Protection D.istrict

This 13™ day of August 2012



WHEREAS, Chapter 70 ILCS 705/ 11 authorizes the Board of Trustees of
the Libertyville Fire Protection District (“Board”) to adopt and enforce fire
prevention codes and standards parallel to national standards; and

WHEREAS, the Board has determined that it is in the best interest of the
District to amend its existing fire prevention code ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the Board has entered into a contract with the Village of
Libertyville to provide fire protection and emergency ambulance services to
persons, business, properties, and other entities within the District’s
responsibility; and

WHEREAS, under the contract between the Boafd and the Village of
Libertyville, the Village of Libertyrville enforces the District’s fire prevention
code; and

WHEREAS, the Board has determined that it is in the best interest of the
District to amend its fire prevention code to conform with amendments that the
Village of Libertyville has made to its fire code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Board of Trustees of the
Libertyville Fire Protection District, Lake County, Illinois, as follows:

Section [. Adoption of the Amended Fire Code

A. That there is hereby adopted for the purpose of prescribing regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or
explosion, a certain code known as the ICC International Fire Code, tirst
printing, excluding ICC duplicate sections indicated with [B], [M], [PM],
etc., and the whole thereof, subject to the amendments made in this

Ofdinance. Three copies of the aforementioned Code have been made



and are now filed with the Libertyville Fire Protection District and the
Village of Libertyville, and the same are hereby adopted and incorporated
as fully as if set out at length herein, and from the date on which this
Ordinance shall take effect, the provisions_ thereof as amended herein
shall be controlling within the limits of the Libertyville Fire Protection
District. If there is any conflict between the language of this Ordinance
and the language of the aforesaid Code, the language of this Ordinance
shall prevail over the language of the aforementioned Code.
That there is hereby adopted for purposes of prescribing regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or
explosion, the Village of Libertyville Ordinance No. 12-0-27, effective
September 1, 2012, adopting the ICC International Fire Code., subject to
the definitions made by this Ordinance in Section 1.C., and subject to the
amendments made by this Ordinance Section III.
Definitions
L Wherever the words “municipality” or “(name of jurisdiction)”
appear in the ICC International Fire Code, they shall be held to
mean th‘e “Libertyville Fire Protection District.”
2, Wherever the words “municipal building code” appear in the ICC
International Fire Code or in this Code, they shall be held to mean
the “Village of Libertyville Municipal Building Code.”

Wherever the term “corporation counsel” is used in the [CC

ol

International Fire Code, it shall be held to mean the “Attorney” for

the Libertyville Fire Protection District,



4. . Wherever the words “code official” or “authority having jurisdiction”
are used in the ICC International Fire Code, they shall be held to
mean the “Director of Fire Prevention” of the Village of Libertyville.

Section lI. Enforcement of the Fire Prevention Code

A. The Fire Prevention Code shall be enforced by the Fire Prevention Bureau
of Libertyville Fire Department as established by the Village of
Libertyville, pursuant to the contractual agreement between the Village of
Libertyville and the Libertyville Fire Protection District.

Section [II. Amendments to the ICC International Fire Code

A. The aforesaid ICC International Fire Code, hereinafter referred to as the
“Code,” is hereby amended by adoption of Article V, Fire Safety
Standards, of the Village of Libertyville Building Code, adopted
September 1, 2012, and attached hereto as Exhibit “A.”

B. Sec. 105.1.2.3. Certificate of Fitness Fees. Certificate of Fitness fees are as

follows:
The use of any explosive material $110.00
Installation, removal, or repair of above ground or $110.00
underground storage tanks
Fire alarm or fire communications systems No Fee
Fire pumps $110.00
Fixed fire suppression systems/hood and duct $110.00
systems :
Portable fire extinguishers $110.00
Hazardous materials storage or use $110.00




C. Séc. 105.4.7. Plan Review and Inspection Services. A fee of seven cents
($0.07) per square foot shall be charged for reviewing all plans pertaining
to tanks, fire alarms, fixed fire suppression systems, and hood and duct
fire suppression éystems. All 13D residential systems shall be charged
$150.00 for alt single family structures. The minimum fee shall be one
hundred dollars ($125.00). Approved plans will not be returned until the
fee is paid, All blueprints or plans of any aforementioned systems that
are required by the applicablé County or local Municipal Fire Code and
its amendmgnts, current Building, Plumbing, and/or Mechanical Codes,

_ or by the Libertyville Fire Protection District shall be submitted to the
Fire Prevention Bureau for review and approval. Each applicant shall pay
the following plan review fees for re-review and site inspection by the
Libertyville Fire Prevention Bureau. Plan review fees shall include re-

reviews along with the preliminary site visits.

Site Plan - New Development $150.00

Life Safety Review -
New Construction and/or large Scale Remodel -
greater than15,000 square feet $150.00

Small Scale Tenant Finish or Remodel - less than | $100.00
15,000 square feet

NOTE: In addition to the review fees listed, the applicant shall pay the actual
costs and expenses incurred by the Libertyville Fire Prevention Bureau for
expenses due to fees charged by consultants or outside contractors.

D. Sec. 105.6. Required Operational Permits, Add the following sentence to



the end of the paragraph: "Required operational permits will be charged a
fee of fifty dollars ($50.00) per year.”

Sec. 106.5. Inspections. Add the following:

Sec. 106.5. Occupancy Inspection and Test Fees. Fees for occupancy
inspections and tests of new fire alarm, fire suppression, and/or tanks
installations shall be conducted when the system is completed. No
chargé shall be imposed for inspections and tests conducted on the first
visit. Visits for any required inspections or tests which cannot be
conducted due to the failure of the owner or installing contractor to
properly and fully install the system to an inspection ready state, shall

be subject to the following charges:

First Visit ) | No Fee
Second Visit $75.00
Third Visit $100.00

Sec. 106.4.1. Fire Inspection Fees. No charge shall be imposed for an
initial fire inspection or the first re-inspection if needed. Visits for any
required re-inspections after the first re-inspection, which is conducted
due to the occupant’s or owner’s failure to correct p.reviously noted

violations, shall be subject to the following charges.

First re-inspection No fee
Second re-inspection $75.00
Third re-inspection $150.00




P

Fourth re-inspection $300.00

Fifth re-inspection ‘ $600.00

*The amount continues to double for each visit until compliance is met.

Section [V. Severability.

A. If any provision of this Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by a Court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect
the validity of the remaining provisions of the this Ordinance.

Section V. Date of Effect.

A, This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its
approval and publica/tiéh'—?s required by law.
PASSED this 13t day of/August 2012.
oy ofBueu

Approved: //1/

Sttict Attorney

/ .
Published: /;;,J J 2012
]

LIBERTYVILL IRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
/? -

AUGUS jW HC( KT\R)I'CSICI }&rrd—Seerefeary

/be/; vt Cuwa. —

CRAIG DOWDEN, Treasurer

fia,e ; i zi.«L/

LEE HAAK ) 32~ irvy

AT’I‘EST

\._12..8‘, M M—Z@

AUGUST W-HOCKPresident-and Secre trary
oo | \—ME’




CERTIFICATE

To All To Whom These Presents Shall Come, Greeting:
e e ,Pm.eﬁl{ : . . .
I, dagust- W Hock; Prestdentand Secretary of the Libertyville Fire
Protection District, do hereby certify that the attached is a true and correct

copy of Ordinance 12-0-05 adopted by the Libertyville Fire Protection District

on August 13, 2012.

Loas Mol

AUGUST-W-HOCK; President-and Secretary
lee lat



DIVISION |. GENERALLY
Secs. 6-361--6-380. Reserved.

DIVISION 2. ICC INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE*
*Cross reference(s)--Fire prevention and protection, Ch. 10,

Sec. 6-381. Adopted.

That there is hereby adopted, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions
hazardous to lite and property from fire or explosion, a certain code known as the 2012
International Fire Code, excluding ICC duplicate sections indicated with [BI, [M], [PM], etc.,
and the whole thereof, subject to the aumendments in this division. Three (3) copies of the
aforementioned code have been made and are filed in the office of the village clerk as prescribed
by law, and the same are adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein, and from
the date on which the ordinance from which this division is derived shall take effect, the
provisions thereof as amended in this division shall be controlling within the limits of the Village
of Libertyville. If there is any conflict between the language of this division and the language of
the aforesaid code, the language of this division shall prevail over the language of the
aforementioned code.

(Ord. No. 90-0-27, ' I(A), 7-10-90)

State law reference(s)-- Adoption by reference, 65 ILCS 5/1-3-1 et seq., 30 ILCS 220/1 et seq.
Cross reference(s)--Definitions and rules of construction generally, ' -2,

Sec. 6-382. Bureau of fire preveption. |

{a) The International Fire Code shalt be enforced by the Bureau of Fire Prevention, which
is hereby established and which shall be operated under the supervision of the Chief of
the Fire Depaitment.

-(b) The Director of Fire Prevention Bureau shall be appointed by the Chief of the Fire
Department of the village and shall serve at his pleasure,

(¢c) The Chief of the Fire Department may detail such members of the Fire Department as
inspectors as shall from time to time be necessary. The Chief of the Fire Department
may recommend to the Village the employment of technical inspectors who are not
sworn members of the Fire Department. When authorized by the Village Board, such
inspectors shall be hired pursuant to established village personnel policies and
procedures.




{Ord. No. 90-0-27, '1I, 7-10-90)
Sec. 6-383, Amendments.

The International Fire Code, as adopted in section 6-381, referred to in this section as "code,” is
amended as follows:

Sec. 101.1 Title. Substitute “[Name of Jurisdiction] with “Village of Libertyville.”

Sec. 101.6 Generally. Change all references of "The International Existing Building Code" to
“The Municipal Building Code." :

Sec. 104 General Authority and responsibility, Add the tollowing:

Sec. 104.6.5 Records. All records are to be obtained by following the Village of Libertyville
Freedom of [nformation Act Policy.

Section 104.7.1 Material and Equipment Reuse. Add to the end of the paragraph; Proper
documentation of repairs/reconditioning of the equipment shall be given to the Libertyville Fire
Department upon request.

Sec. 104.10.2 Reporting Hazurdous Locations.  Any person discovering the evidence of
spontancous heating or other abnormal heating of any kind in any building, marine vessel,
appliance, apparatus, tank, or open stack or pile, or any person upon discovering or being
apprised of an uncontrolled hazardous gas leak or hazardous material or flammable and/or
combustible liquid spill, shall immediately notify the Libertyville Fire Department.

Sec. 105 Permits. Add the following:

Sec. 105.1.2.1 Required Construction Permits and Certificates of Fitness. Add to the end of the
paragraph, AWhen a Certificate of Fitness is required by this jurisdiction for performance of
activities related to fire safety, the Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau shall be responsible for
its issuance.@

(a) All applications for a Certificate of Fitness shall be filed with the Fire Prevention
: Bureau on forms provided by that office.

Ab)- Every person applying for a Certificate of Fitness shall furnish satisfactory proot to the
Director of Fire Prevention that he/she is familiar with the materials, formulas, tools,
techniques, standards, laws, ordinances, recognized good practices, safety precautions,
and manufacturers= recommendations pertaining to the particular system, materials,
devices, or operations he will be involved with, and for which the Certificate of Fitness
is issued. They shall further prove that their company is professionally competent to
perform any and all actions necessary and incidental to the operation for which the
Certificate of Fitness is issued, and shall provide insurance and any applicable license.



(d)

(e)

{h)

(1)

(i)

The Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau shall investigate every application for a
Certificate of Fitness. The investigation shall include an examination of the applicant
as to his experience and training in the field of the Certificate of Fitness for which he
has applied. The examination may include a practical test. When the Director of Fire
Prevention determines that the applicant for the Certificate of Fitness contorms to all of
the requirements of this Code, he shail issue the Certificate of Fitness.

When the Director of Fire Prevention determines that an applicant is not fit to receive
the Certiticate of Fitness because ot his inability to comply with the provisions of this
Code, he shall refuse to issue the Certificate of Fitness. If the refusal is based upon the
applicants inability to pass a written examination which is given to determine
competency, the applicant may not apply again for the Certificate of Fitness within a
ninety (90) day period following the examination.

When the Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau determines that an individual is not fit
to hold a Certificate of Fitness because of his inability to comply with the provisions of
the Code, he shall inform that individual of his right to a hearing prior to the revocation
of his Certificate of Fitness. If the Certificate of Fitness holder desires a hearing, he
shall notify the Chief of the Fire Department in writing within ten (10) working days of
his receipt of the revocation notice from the Chief. The Hearing Board shall issue a
written recommendation to the Chief regarding its findings within fifteen (15) days of
the hearing, and the Chief shall issue his decision within a reasonable time thereafter,
and the said decision shall be final. Failure to show just cause shall result in the
revocation of the Certificate of Fitness by the Chief of the Fire Department. The
Hearing Board shall be comprised of the Fire Chief, and the Director of the Fire
Prevention Bureau. :

Certificates of Fitness shall not be transferable.

Certificates of Fitness shall be issued for the period of time shown on the face of the
Certificate of Fitness as determined by the Director of Fire Prevention, but such period
of time shall not exceed two (2) years.

Applications for renewal of a Certificate of Fitness shall be filed in the same manner as
an application for an original Certificate, Each such application shall be accompanied
by applicable fees. The granting of a renewal of a Certificate of Fitness shall be
accomplished in the same manner as for an original Certificate of Fitness.

The Director of Fire Prevention is authorized upon application therefore, to issue

Certificates of Fitness that are restricted to one or more activities, systems, items,
devices or to a particular premises.

Each person holding a Certificate of Fitness shall notify the Director of Fire Prevention
in writing of any change in his business, residential, or other notification address within
ten (10) days after such change. Failure on the part of a person to give such notification
shall constitute grounds for revocation of said Certificate of Fitness.



)

(D

(5)

(6)

(k)

A Certificate of Fitness issued by the Director of Fire Prevention shall be in the form of
a certificate that can be framed. Said certificate shall contain the following
information: : :

Any person to whom a Certificate of Fitness has been granted in contormance with this
Code shall upon request, produce and show proper identification and his Certificate of
Fitness to anyone for whom he seeks to render his services or to the Director of Fire
Prevention.

The purpose for which the Certiticate of Fitness has been issued.
The date the Certificate of Fitness is issued and the date of expiration,

Other information as may be necessary to properly identify the person to whom the
Certificate of Fitness is issued.

The name and signature of the Director of the Fire Prevention who issued the Certilicate
of Fitness, or his designee=s name and rank or title.

Printed thereon, in bold type, shall be the following: ATHIS CERTIFICATE OF
FITNESS DOES NOT RECOMMEND THE BEARER FOR EMPLOYMENT NOR
ASSUME  RESPONSIBILITY OR  LIABILITY FOR THE BEARERS
PERFORMANCE.@

A Certificate of Fitness or permit shall not be issued until the designated fees have been
paid.

Sec. 105.1.2.3 Certificate of Fitness Fees. Certiticate of Fitness fees are as follows:

The use of any explosive material $110.00

Installation, removal, or repair of aboveground or $110.00
underground storage tanks

Fire alarm or fire communications systems No Fee

Fire pumps | STI0.00

Fixed fire suppression systems/ hood and duct systems | $110.00

Portable fire extinguishers $110.00

Hazardous materials storage or use $110.00

Sec.105.3.9  Temporary Permits. When a temporary hazardous situation is anticipated or
discovered for conditions not otherwise regulated by this Code, the Fire Code Official is



authorized based on applicable data, to issue a temporary permit with appropriate conditions
deemed necessary for the safety, health, and welfare of the public.

Sec.105.3.10 Permits (General). Any permits issued under this Code, shall not take the place of
any other license or permit required by the Code laws or permit required by the Code laws of the
Jurisdiction.

Sec. [054.7 Plan Review uand Inspection Services. A fee of seven cents ($0.07) per square foot
shall be charged for reviewing all plans pertaining to tanks, fire alarms, fixed fire suppression
systems, and hood and duct fire suppression systems. All 13D residential systems shall be
charged $150.00 for all single family structures. The minimum fee shall be one hundred twenty
five dollars ($125.00) Approved plans will not be returned until the fee is paid. All blueprints
or plans of any aforementioned systems that are required by the applicable County or local
Municipal Fire Code and its amendments, current Building, Plumbing, and/or Mechanical Codes,
shall be submitted to the Fire Prevention Bureau for review and approval. Each applicant shall
pay the following plan review fees for re-review and site inspection by the Libertyville Fire
Prevention Bureau. Plan review fees shall include re-reviews along with the preliminary site
visits,

Site Plan - New Development $150.00

Life Safety Review -
New Construction and/or Large Scale Remodel - greater than 15,000 sq. ft. $150.00

Small Scale Tenant Finish or Remodel - less than 15,000 sq. ft, $100.00

NOTE: In addition to the review fees listed, the applicant shall pay the actual costs and
expenses incurred by the Libertyville Fire Prevention Bureau for expenses due to fees charged
by consultants or outside contractors,

. 105.6 Required Operational Permits. Add the following sentence to the end of the
paraordph ARequired operational permits will be charged a fee of fifty do[iats ($50.00) per
yedr.@

,
Sec. 106.5 Inspections. Add the following:

Sec.[06.5 Inspection and Test Fees. Fees for occupancy inspections and tests of new fire alarm,
tire suppression, and/or tanks instailations shall be conducted when the system is completed. No
charge shall be imposed for inspections and tests conducted on the first visit. Visits for any
required inspections or tests which cannot be conducted due to the failure of the owner or
installing contractor to properly and fully install the system to an inspection ready state, shall be
subject to the following charges:

(I L 1




First visit No fee

Second visit | $75.00
Third visit $100.00

Sec. 108 Board of Appeals. Remove the section in the Code book and replace with the
following:

Sec. 108.1 Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders,
decisions or determinations made by the Fire Code Official relative to the application and
interpretation of this Code, there shaill be a board of appeals consisting of members who are
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to this Code. The Board shall
_consist of the following members:

{1} The Chief of the Fire Department.
(2) The Building Commissioner.
(3) The Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau,

The Board shall adopt rules of procedures for conducting its business, and shall render all
decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy to the Code Official.

Sec, 113.3 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance. After the words “in addition to,” add
the words “and “equal to.”

Sec. 202 General Definitions. Remove the definition of the Fire Code Official in the code
book and add the following:

Municipality or (nume of jurisdiction) shall be held to mean the AVillage of Libertyville.@
Cm‘poration counsel shall be held to mean the AAttorney@ for the Village of Libertyville.

Fire Code official or authority having jurisdiction shall be held to mean the Fire Chief or the
Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau of the Libertyville Fire Department. '

See. 301 General. Add the tollowing:

Sec. 3013 ftems Not Specifically Covered. Whenever or wherever a condition is found in any
building, lot, or premises, that in the opinion of the Director of Fire Prevention is not
specifically covered by the provisions of this Chapter, but that requires correction or removal for
the protection of the occupants or the public, the Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau shall
order such conditions be corrected or removed and the owner or occupant of such buildings, lots,
or premises shall comply with such orders.

Sec. 304 Combustible Waste Materials. Add the following:



Sec. 304.1.4 Sweeping Compounds. Only approved water solutions or detergent floor sweeping
compounds, and grease absorbents shall be used for cleaning floors. The use of sawdust or
similar combustible or flammable liquids spilled from machinery or processed on any floor is
prohibited.

Sec. 305 Ignition Sources. Add the following:

Sec. 305.5 Portable Heaters. Portable heaters shall be designed and located so that they cannot
be easily overturned. The Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau may prohibit the use of
portable heaters in occupancies or situations in which such use or operation would present an
undue danger to the life or property of others.

Sec. 305.6 Heuting und Lighting Apparatus. Proper clearance (a minimum of 36 inches) shall
be maintained between lighting and heat producing equipment and combustibles so that
continuous operation at full capacity will not increase the tempemture of the surrounding
combustibles to their flash point or ignition temperature.

See. 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Portable Qutdoor Fireplaces. Add the
following:

Sec. 307. 1.1 Prohibited Open Burning. Add a second exception to read us follows:

Exception 2. When sustained winds are between 5-15 mph as indicated at the website
www.weather.com for current weather conditions in the 60048 location code.  Other
considerations include but are not limited to wind gust speed, outdoor relative humidity and
vegetation moisture status.

Sec. 307.4  Location. Add the following to the end of Exception I: Approved portable fire
pits/places or firepits built into the ground shall be considered as approved containers.

Sec. 307.6 Spread of Fire. No person shall knowingly permit any fire to spread so as to
endanger the life or property of another or use or operate any device which may be a source of
ignition, - unless proper removal of flammable material surrounding the operation is
accomplished, or such other reasonable precautions are taken to ensure against the starting or
spreading of unfriendly fires.

Sec, 308.3 Group A Occupancies. In the first sentence of Exception 1. add the following after
the word “provided™ *that precautions shall be submitted in writing to the Fire Code Official
prior to the event accurring, and provided that”:

Sec. 315 Miscellaneous Combustible Material Storage. Revise the following:

Sec 315.3 Storage in Buildings. Add at the end of the paragraph the following: “Minimum
clearance from heaters or heating devices shall be 36 inches,”



Sec. 3154 Outside Storage. Add to the end of the paragraph: ANor shall outdoor storage be
closer than fifteen (15) feet to any structure.@

Sec. 506.1 Where Required (Key Boxes). Add the following to end ot the paragraph:

() Approval:  The Libertyville Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau
shall approve all lock boxes and box sizes. A Knox vault box may be required if
there are more than 4 keys for the building or each space shall have a Knox key
box.

() Where Required: All occupancies having automatic fire alarm systems
shall have a Knox key lock box installed in a location approved by the
Libertyville Fire Department, Fire Preveation Bureau. All occupancies with
locked gates shall have a box or a Knox key system for the gate.

(3)  Supervision: Where required by the Libertyville Fire Department, the key
lock box shall be electronically supervised and connected to the fire alarm
system,

{(4)  Contents: The key lock box shall contain all keys for the locked areas of
the building as required by the Libertyville Fire Department. Said keys shall
include, but not be limited to, all areas of the building, the automatic fire alarm
system, and a manual pull box resetting tool.

Sec. 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies. Delete Section 507.5.1.1 in its entirety and replace
with the following:

Sec. 507.5.1.1 Hydrant for Standpipe and Sprinkler Svstems. Buildings equipped with a
standpipe system installed in accordance with Section 905 and/or a sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903, shall have a fire hydrant within 150 feet of the Fire Department
connections.

Sec, 509 Fire protection and utility identification and access.

Sec 509.1 Identification. Add the following to the end of the paragraph: The signs shall be in
contrasting color to the door and the letters shall be a minimum of 4" high and a ¥2” wide. The
signs shall read “*Sprinkler Riser Room™ and/or F.A.C.P.

Sec. 605 Electrical equipment, wiring and hazards.

Sec. 605.3 Working space and clearance. Change the wmkmg space of not less that 30" in width
to not less than 36” in width,

Sec, 605.5.1 Power supply. Delete the following: “power tap or multi plug adapter and except
for approved multi plug extension cords, shall serve only one portable appliance.



Sec. 605.10 Portable, electric space heaters. Add new Section 605.10.5. Add Section 605.10.6
as follows:

Sec. 605.10.5 Tip over protection. All approved portable space heaters shall have built in tip
" over protection,

Sec. 605.10.6 Prohibited heaters. Portable space heaters that have exposed heating elements
shall be prohibited.

Sec. 607 Elevator Recall and Maintenance. Add the following:

Sec. 607.6  Elevator Cuar Requirements. Elevator cars are to accommodate the ambulance
stretcher. At least one elevator shall be of such a size and arrangement to be accommodate a 24
inch x 84 inch ambulance stretcher in the horizontal, open position and shall be identified by the
international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life) The symbol shall not be less
than 3 inches high and shall be placed inside of both sides of the hoist way doorframe. The cab
size is to be a minimuin 5 foot x 7 foot platform and a minimum 2500 |b capacity with a 42" side
slide door.

Sec, 609 Commercial Kitchen Hoods. Add the following:

Sec. 609.2.1 General. Bach existing required commercial or other occupancy kitchen exhaust
hood and duct system shall be protected with an approved wet chemical fire suppression system
installed and maintained per NFPA 17, and the UL 300 Standard. Every required automatic fire
suppression system, when activated, shall transmit a fire alarm signal to the Libertyville Fire
Communications Center via an approved fire alarm system, and making use of the Village radio
system.

Sec. 806 Decorative Vegetation. Delete the following sections in their entirety: Sec. 806.1
through Sec.806. 1.3, and replace with the following:

Sec. 806.1 Natural Cut Trees. Natural cut trees shall not be allowed in any occupancy, except
single family homes.

Sec. 806.2 through 806.5 These sections shall remain as is.
See. 901, General. Add the following:

Sec. 901.4.7 Fire Protection Control Rooms. The Fire Prevention Bureau shall approve the
location of the sprinkler riser room and the fire alarm control panel. The fire protection
equipment shall be located on a street or parking lot and shail have a separate exterior entrance
door to the room. All related fire protection equipment shall be located within this room, unless
otherwise approved by the Fire Code Official,

Sec. 901.4.8 Zoning of Fire Protection Systems. Each floor shall be zoned separately. If the
tloor area exceeds 10,000 square feet, then additional zoning may need to be provided. The



length of any zone shall not exceed 100 feet in any direction.

Exception 1: When in the opinion of the Fire Prevention Bureau, the building contiguration is
such that it does not interfere with proper ftire suppression intervention, and additional zoning is
therefore not necessary, then the Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau may waive the above
requirements.

Sec. 901.6.2.2 Record Maintenance. Any company performing system inspections, testing or
maintenance on required or non-required fire protection systems shall submit the report of said
inspection, testing or maintenance to a third party reporting company approved by the
Libertyville Fire Departrment.

Sec. 903, Automatic Sprinkler Systems. Revise the following:

Sec. 903.1 General. Add the following to the paragraph: Aand the Village of Libertyville
Municipal Code Section 6 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems. The Village of Libertyville
Sprinkler Ordinance shall supercede any contlicting area of Section 903.@

Sec. 903.2 Where required. Delete this section and insert the following:

Approved aitomatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be provided in all
Use Groups described in this Code. Automatic sprinkler systems must be installed in accordance
with applicable NFPA standards, manufacturer’s recommendations, UL listings, and good fire
safety procedures. Automatic sprinkler systems must be maintained in full operating condition at
all times. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in all new residential Use Groups
including town homes/multi-family dwellings and one and two family dwellings which are
adopted by this Code. All new single family dwellings shall have automatic fire sprinklers
installed throughout per NFPA (3R or 13D. All new town homes shall have automatic fire
sprinklers installed throughout per NFPA 13R or 13D. All new attached garages shall have
automatic sprinklers installed, where feasible. Dry sidewall or dry pendant sprinklers should be
used.

Sec. 903.3.1.1.1 Exempt Locations. Delete item numbers 3 and 4 from this section.

Sec. 903.3.7 Fire Departinent Connections. Add the following to the paragraph, AThe sprinkler
system demand may require a 5 inch storz connection with a removable 227 Siamese
connection.@ ’

Sec. Y03.4.2 Alarms. Delete this section and replace with the following:

Sec 903.4.2 Notification Devices. Each sprinkler or standpipe riser shall be equipped with a 24-
volt de (V.D.C.) white strobe light powered from the fire alarm system batteries and shall be
activated by the flow switch. Each riser room shall have a 24 V.D.C. interior water flow bell and
this bell shall be activated by the water flow switch. There shall aiso be a 24V.D.C. white strobe
light and a 24 V.D.C, bell mounted on the exterior of the building over the fire department
connection. These shall activate only upon water flow



Sec. 903.4.3 Floor control valves. Delete this section and replace with the following:

Sec. 903.4.3 Sprinkler Control Valves. All new and existing sprinkler control valves shall be
equipped with electronic supervision (tamper switches) in accordance with NFPA 72, All
supervisory signals shall be transmitted to the Libertyville Communications Center.

Sec. 903.4.4 Multiple Occupant Buildings. A building having multiple occapancies shall have
separate zoning for each occupancy space or tloor. Each occupant or tloor where practical shall
have an exterior flashing strobe light red in color in an approved location, the strobe light shall
be connected with the fire alarm system and shali be activated by a water flow or smoke
condition in the occupant space. If the building or space cannot be separated by a flow switch,
then a complete smoke detector system shall be installed and connected to an addressable fire
alarm panel.  All signals shall be transmitted to the Village of Libertyville Communications
Center.

Sec. 905 Standpipe Systems. Revise the following:

Sec. 905.3 Required Installations. Add the following paragraph to Section 305.3, AAll required
standpipe systems shall be supplied by a separate riser. The supply riser shall be hydraulically
designed to supply 22 inch hose drops. The riser system shall be equipped with a separate
control valve and flow swiltch. The standpipe shall be a 22 inch gated connection with a [2 inch
reducer, and all {ocations shall be approved by the Fire Prevention Bureau, All standpipe and
sprinkler risers shall have separate control valves and flow switches per floor.

Sec. 905.3.1 Building Height. Change the Class I standpipe to a Class [ standpipe, and change
the wording in the paragraph to read, A30 feet or more.@ not Amore than 30 feet.@

Sec, 906 Portable Fire Extinguishers. Revise the following:

Sec. 906.3 Size und Distribution. Add to the end of the paragraph. The minimum size ABC dry
chemical fire extinguisher permitted shall be 10 pound (4A:40B:C) unless approved otherwise by
the Code Official. Fire extinguishers shall have 3 dimensional signs mounted above them
approximately 80 inches A.F.F. and they shall also have current service tags.

Sec. 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. Revise the following:

Sec.Y07.1.3 Equipinent.  Add the following: All fire alarm control panels shall be addressabte
and shall be capable of having the audio signal silenced without resetting the fire alarm control
panel. All fire alarm control panels shall have an approved method of placing the system in a
trouble mode at the location of the alarm panel.

Sec. 907.1.3.1 Equipment. All conventional fire alarm panels that are upgraded to an addressable
panel shall require the installation o pull stations and A.D.A. compliant audio visual devices
throughout the building, These devices shall be installed per NFPA 72 and the State of {llinois
Accessibility Code.



Sec. 907.2 Where Required, Add the following to the first paragraph, AAH buildings that are
equipped with a required alarm system shall be provided with a manual fire alarm system,
including pull stations, and A.D.A. compliant audio visual devices. These devices shall be
installed per N.F.P.A. 72, and the State ot [llinois Accessibility Code.@

Sec. 907.2.1 through 907.2.7 Delete the exceptions tor Groups A, B, E, F, [, I-2, and M.

Sec. 907.2.10 Single und Multiple Station Smoke Alarms. Add the following wording after (72),
Aand per the current State of [Hinois Smoke Detector Act.@

Sec. 907.4.1 Location. Delete the exception.

Sec.907.5.2.3.1.1 Public and common areas. Add the following: In some cases, the
Libertyville Fire Department may require audible alarm notification devices in place of visible
notitication devices in public or common areas such as rest rooms.

Sec. 907.6.5 Monitoring. Delete the wording and replace with, AWhere required, all fire alarms
shall transmit to the Libertyville Communications Center and all signals shall be transmitted via
the Village of Libertyville A.E.S. radio system.@

Sec. 907.8.5.1 Fualse Alarms. No person shall deliberately or maliciously turn in an alarm of fire
when in fact that person knows that no fire exists. No person shall activate any installed fire
warning system or any fixed fire extinguishing system for purposes other than emergency,.
maintenance, drills, or prescribed testing.

See. 912 Fire Department connections. Add the following Section:

Sec, 912.2.3 Newly constructed buildings. FDC signs may also be required on newly constructed
buildings as required by the code official. The signs shall read “FDC™ and have letters that are at
least 6™ high and words with letters at least 2” high or an arrow to indicate the location. Signs
shall be subject to approve of the code official.

Sec. 913 Fire Pumps.

Sec. 913.4 Vualve Supervision. Delete methods 1 through 4, and replace with the following,
AValve supervision will transmit a supervisory alarm to the Libertyville Communications Center
by an clectroriic tamper switch.@

Sec. 914 Fire protection based on special detailed requirements of use and occupancy.
Revise the subsections as follows:

Sec. 914.7.1 Automatic sprinkler system. In the exception, at the end of the paragraph add the
following: temporary shall be 180 days or less. Reference section 3103 of the IBC.

Sec. 1103 Fire safety requirements for existing buildings, Revise subsections as follows:



.

Sec. 1103.7.1 Group E. Delete the exceptions,
Sec, 1103.7.2 Group {-1. Delete the exceptions.
Sec. 1103.7.3 Group [-2. Delete the exception.

Sec. 1103.7.5.1 Group R-I hotel and motel manual fire alurm system. Delete e'«:eptlon 2inits
entirety.

Sec. 1103.7.5.2 Group R-1 boarding and rooming houses manual fire alurm system. Delete the
exception in its entirety.

Sec. 1’103. 7.6 Group R-2. Delete exception 2 in its entirety.

Sec. 1103.7.7 Group R-4. Delete the exceptions.

Sec. 2108 Fire Protection. Revise subsection as follows:

Sec. 2108.2 Automatic Sprinkler Systems. Delete the exceptions in their entirety.

Sec 3103.2 Approval Required. Add to the end of the paragraph: “approval must be obtained
from the t‘ire code official a minimum of five (5) working days prior to the event.”

Sec. 3103.5 Use Period. Add the tol[owmo for the purpose of this code, the 12 month period
will be a calendar year.

Sec. 3103.8.2 Location. In the first sentence of Exception 2 and after the word “tents”, add
“when not used for cooking.” And after the word “buildings”, add *, lot lines, and parked
vehicles or internal combustion engines,”

Sec. 5005,4.5 Vehicles Transporting Hazards. Add the following section:

Sec. 5005.4.5 Vehicles Transporting Hazards. The routes for vehicles transporting hazardous
chemicals and other dangerous articles as described in Chapter 50 of the Intematlonal Fire Code
2012 edition are hereby established as follows:

() The routes tor the Interstate or Intrastate shipments not intended for
delivery within the corporate limits of the Village of Libertyville are Interstate
294, County Highway 41, St. Mary=s Road, Butterfield Road, Route 137, and that
portion of Route 21, north of Route 137.

{(2) Shipments within the Village of Libertyville shall have the written
permission of the Fire Department. Without such approval, no stopping or
parking of these vehicles or shipments shall be allowed within the Village limits,
except for the purpose of inspection by the Fire Prevention Bureau to ensure



compliance with the Code adopted by Section 1.

Sec. 5601.9 Establishment of Limits of Districts in Which Storage of Explosives and Blasting
Agents Is to Be Prohibired. The limits referred to in this section of the International Fire Code
2012 edition in which storage of explosive materials is prohibited are hereby established as
tollows:

All commercial zones, business zones, and residential zoned property in the Village and District.
Sec. 5608 Fireworks Displays. Add the following section:

Sec. 5608.3.1 Prohibited displays. The use of Chinese fire lanterns or sky lanterns shall be
prohibited within the Village of Libertyville boundaries.

See, 5610 Add the following section:

Sec. 5610.1.1.1 Establishing Motor Vehicle Routes for Vehicles Transporting Explosives and
Blasting Agents. Transportation Routes: The routes referred to in the International Fire Code
2012 edition for vehicles transporting explosives and blasting agents are hereby established as
follows:

(a) The routes ot Interstate or Intrastate shipments are Interstate 294, County
Highway 41, St. Mary=s Road, Butterfield Road, Route 137, and that portion of Route
21, north of Route 137.

(b) Shipments within the Village of Libertyville shall have written approval from the
Fire Department. Without such approval, no stopping or parking of these vehicles or
shipments shall be allowed within the Village limits, except tor the purpose of inspection
by the Fire Prevention Bureau to ensure compliance with this Code as Adopted by
Chapter . :

Sec, 6-384. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances. All former Ordinances or parts thereof,
contlicting or inconsistent with the provisions of this Ordinance or of the Code hereby adopted
are hereby repealed.

Sec. 6-385. Severability. If any provision of this Code is for any reason held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by a Court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect the validity of the

. remaining provisions of this Code.

Sec. 6-386. Date of Effect. This Ordinance shall take etfect and be in force from and after its
approval and publication in pamphlet form as required by law.

Secs, 6-387--6-400. Reserved.

DIVISION 3. AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS*



Sec, 6-401. Definitions.

The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this division, shall have the meanings
ascribed to them in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a different meaning:

Alternative fire protection means the use of either or both (i) fire resistive construction and (ii)
fire alarm, fire detecting, or fire extinguishing equipment (other than an automatic ftire sprinkler
system) to reduce the risk of personal injury and property damage from fire and the spread of
fire.

Automatic fire sprinkler system means an automatic fire sprinkler system meeting the applicable
National Fire Protection Association ("NFPA") standard or standards set forth in section 6-403.

Building, for purposes of this Division, shall be as defined in the International Building Code
(IBC) as adopted by the village in section 6-161. For purposes of this Division, a building shall
further be defined as a structure which is situated entirely within a Lot of Record (as defined by
the Village of Libertyville Zoning Code) or which traverses one or more Lots of Record under a
single ownership. ‘

Buiilding code means the [nternational Building Code, as adopted by the village in section 6-161
or any subsequent edition adopted by the village in the future.

Cosmetic improvement means any alterations to an existing building that affects only such
existing building's appearance. Interior cosmetic improvements shall include, but not be limited
to, painting, wallpapering, floor coverings, and nonbearing movable wall partitions. Exterior
cosimetic improvements shall include, but not be limited to, new signs, painting, architectural
trim, and repair or replacement of facades, windows, doors and roofs coverings. The addition of
a rain roof to the structure is not included in the cosmetic improvement and will be treated as an
addition to the building. ‘

Fire area means the floor area enclosed and bounded by fire walls, fire barriers, or exterior walls
of a‘building to restrict the spread of fire, Fire walls which divide a building (as defined by this
Division) shall not be considered as interrupting the square foot measurement of the entire
building when calculating the square foot area necessary to require sprinklers,

Wark area shall be as detined in the [nternational Existing Building Code (IEBC) Sec.202.

(Ord. No. 96-0-01, 22, 1-10-96)

Cross reference(s)--Definitions and rules of construction generally, 71-2.

*Editor's note--Ordinance No. 96-0-01, ?2, adopted January 10, 1996, amended 776-401--6-407
by adding new 776-401--6-408. Formerly, such provisions pertained to automatic sprinkler
systems and derived from Ord. No. 91-0-53, 7?1--7, 10-22-91.



Sec, 6-402, Conilicts.

To the greatest extent possible, the provisions of this division shall be construed to be consistent
with, and not in contlict with, the provisions of any other law or ordinance, including the
provisions of the Building Code, to the end that all such provisions may be given their fullest
application. However, in case of any conflict between this division and the provisions of the
Building Code, the provisions of this division shall control.

(Ord. No. 96-0-01, 72, 1-10-96)
Sec, 6-403. NIFPA standards.

Al automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be designed, installed and maintained in compliance
with the following referenced standards as determined by the Director of the Fire Prevention
Bureau to be applicable:

NFPA [3. The 2010 edition of the National Fire Protection Association's (NFPA) Standard for
the Installation of Sprinkler Systems.

NFPA 13D. The 2010 edition of the National Fire Protection Association's (NFPA) Standard for
the Installution of Sprinkier Svstems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured
Homes.

NEFPA [3R. The 2010 edition of the National Fire Protection Association's (NFPA) Standard for
the Installation of Sprinkler systems in Residential Occupancies up to and including Four Stories
in Height.

NFPA 14, The 2010 edition of the National Fire Protection Association’s (NFPA) Standard for
the Installation of Stundpipe and Hose Systems.

NFPA 20. The 2010 edition of the National Fire Protection Association’s (NFPA) Standard for
the Installation of Centrifugal Fire Pumps.

NFPA 25 The 2011 edition of the National Fire Protection Association's (NFPA) Standurd for
the Inspection, Testing and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems.

NFPA 72. The 2010 edition of the National Fire Protection Association's (NFPA) Standard for
the Installation of Fire Systems’ National Fire Alarm Code.

Every reference to a NFPA standard in this division shall be deemed to refer to the edition of
such standard set forth in this section 6-403,

(Ord. No. 96-0-01, 72, 1-10-96)

Sec, 6-404. New buildings.



(a) When and where required. Except as provided in subsection 6-404(b) and
6-404(c) and section 6-406, for all new buildings an automatic fire sprinkler
system shall be required throughout all areas. A residential building shall be
considered "new” when i) a building is built where no building stands or ii)
100% of an existing building is a reconstruction work area due to extensive
alterations-as defined in the 2012 International Residential Code (IRC) App.J Sec.
AJ 201 and AJ501.3; or iii) alteration of more than 50% of the existing building
area, excluding non-habitable basement areas, where no existing habitable room is
continucusly maintained as occupiable with no renovation, alteration, or
reconstruction in that room. For purposes of this section, occupiable does not
mean habitable overnight but it does require a means of egress through an
approved exit discharging into the public right-of-way,

{b) Alternative fire protection for new buildings. When-the Fire Chief, Director of the
Fire Prevention Bureau and Building Commissioner make a unanimous written
determination, based on factors such as building, size, building construction type,
location of the building on the property, and the availability or appropriateness of
water as an extinguishing agent, that the public health, safety, welfare, and the
lives and property of individuals will be adequately suafeguarded by alternative
fire protection to be provided pursuant to specific plans approved and
incorporated as part ot such written determination, then, on condition that such
alternative fire protection is provided, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall not
be required pursuant to this section 6-404.

{c) Exception. Notwithstanding subsection 6-404(a) and 6-404(b) above, neither an
automatic fire sprinkler system nor alternative fire protection shall be required for
any detached accessory structure that is one thousand (1,000) square feet or less in
building area and only one story in height and without a basement.

{Ord. No. 96-0-01, 72, 1-10-96)
Sec. 6-405, Existing buildings.
(a) Increases in fire areas of existing buildings.

(1) Currently sprinklered buildings. Except as provided in subsection 6-405(d) and
section 6-406, when any existing building that is classified in a use group that
would, if newly constructed, be required to have an automatic fire sprinkler
system pursuant to section 6-404 and is protected by an automatic fire sprinkler
system, is added to, remodeled, or altered in any manner that increases the fire
areas of the building, regardless of the cost or amount of increase in fire areas, the
additional fire areas shall also be protected by an automatic fire sprinkler system.

(2) Currently non-sprinklered buildings. Except as provided in subsection 6-405(d)
and section 6-406, when any existing building that is not protected by an
automatic fire sprinkler system; and that is not regulated by the International



Residential Code (IRC) as adopted in Sec. 6-211; and that would, if newly
constructed, be required to have an automatic fire sprinkler system pursuant to
section 6-404 is added to, remodeled or altered in any manner that increases the
fire areas of the building, regardless ot the cost, so that the fire areas of the entire
building, including the fire areas of the building that were added, remodeled, or
altered, are more than three thousand two hundred (3,200) square feet, then the
fire areas of the entire building, including the fire areas of the building that were
added, remodeled, or altered, shall be protected by an automatic fire sprinkler
systemn.

{b) Remodeling or alterutions to existing buildings. Except as provided in subsection

6-405(d) and section 6-406, when any existing building that is not regulated by the
International Residential Code (IRC) as adopted in Sec. 6-211; and that would, if
newly constructed, be required to have an automatic fire sprinkler system pursuant to
section 6-404 is remodeled or altered during any 30 month period when 1) the work
area exceeds fifty (50) percent of the aggregate area of the building or ii) the cost of
the project is more than twenty-five (25) percent of the Lake County Supervisor of
Assessments' full estimated market value of the building, excluding any cost for the
installation of any required automatic fire sprinkler system and any cost for cosmetic
improvements, then the fire areas of the entire building shall be protected with an
auwtomatic fire sprinkler system, regardless of whether such remodeling or alteration
results in an increase in the fire areas of the building.

Changes in use group. Except as provided in subsection 6-405(d) and section 6-406,
if the use of any building is changed such that it is classitied in a use group requiring
sprinklers, such building shall comply with the provisions of section 6-404 as if it
were a newly constructed building.

(d) Alternative fire protection for existing buildings. When the Fire Chief, Director of the

AN

Fire Prevention Bureau and Building Commissioner make a unanimous written
determination, based on factors such as building size, building construction type,
location of the building on the property, the availability or appropriateness of water as
an extinguishing agent, the size of a new addition, percentage of remodeling or
alterations, and the change in use group classification, that the public health, safety
and welfare and the lives and property of individuals will be adequately safeguarded
by alternative fire protection to be provided pursuant to specific plans approved and
incorporated as part of such written determination, then, on condition that such
alternative fire protection is provided, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall not be
required pursuant to this section 6-405.

(e) Alternative timing for installation of automatic sprinkler system in existing multi-

tenant/condominitun buildings.  Whenever the provisions of this section 6-403
requires the installation of an automatic fire-sprinkler system throughout an existing
multi-tenant or condominium building, then each currently existing and occupied
tenant space or condominium unit within said building and outside of the work area
of the related building permit may remain unsprinklered for a period not to exceed



five (5) years following the issuance of the current permit, subject to the following
restrictions and conditions:

I} Upon the vacation of an occupied tenant space or condominium unit the
vacated space or unit must be sprinklered prior to any further occupancy; and

2)  When any future remodeling or alteration takes place within any currently
unsprinklered tenant space or condominium unit involving a  work area
which exceeds fifty percent (50%) of the aggregate area of such space or
unit, the tenant space or condominium unit must be sprinklered
simultaneously with the completion of the future work; and

3) At the time of the issuance of the current permit the water service and
sprinkler system shall be designed for the entire building; and

4) The building water service and sprinkler system shall be installed in the
building permit work area(s) and all common areas; and

5} At the time of issuance of the current permit a signed statement must be is
received from the property owner indicating his/her understanding of and
guarantee that the entire building will be sprinklered as required above and
no later than 5 years from the date of the issuance of the current permit.

(Ord. No. 96-0-01, 72, 1-10-96)
Sec. 6-406. Public utility electrical rooms, buildings and vaults.

Any new electrical equipment room, building or vault that is installed, serviced, secured and
maintained by a public utility company that is regulated by the [llinois Commerce Commission
and that complies with all of the conditions of paragraphs (1) through (6) of this section shall not
be required to instalt an automatic fire sprinkler system pursuant to this division.

(I} An alternative fire suppression system approved by the Director of the Fire
Prevention Bureau shall be installed in the electrical equipment room, building or
vault,

{2) An automatic fire detection system approved by the Director of the Fire Prevention
Bureau that meets the requirements of NFPA 72-shall be installed in the electrical
equipment room, building or vault; provided, however, that the fire and trouble alarm
signal shall be transmitted to the fire alarm control panel,

{3) The electrical equipment room, building or vault shall be constructed with walls,
floors and ceilings that have a minimum of a one-hour fire resistive rating.

(4) All doors to or within the electrical equipment room, building or vault shall have a
minimum of a one-hour fire-rated door assembly with self-closing devices, and any



other openings or penetrations into this room, building, or vault shall be protected
with a minimum of a one-hour fire rated assembly.

(5) A portable fire extinguisher, with a minimum rating of 2A40BC, shall be installed
inside the electrical room, building, or vault within ten (10) feet of each exit and one
shall also be provided on the exterior of the room or vault at the entrance door.

{Ord. No. 96-0-01, 72, 1-10-96)
Sec. 6-407. Supervision of systems,

Every automatic fire sprinkler system, except single family residential systems regulated by the
[nternational Residential Code (IRC) as adopted in Sec. 6-211, installed within the Village,
whether or not such system is required by this division, shall be electronically supervised by an
approved addressable fire alarm-system located in the riser room. If such area is not accessible
from the exterior of the building, the fire alarm control panel shall be located in a location
approved by the Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau. Every automatic tire sprinkler system
installed within the village, whether or not such system is required by this division, shall have a
direct connection to the fire department dispatch center meeting the requirements of NFPA 72 for
remote stations and shall be transmitted via the Village radio system. A sprinkler system for only
local protection and one which does not have electronic supervision, will not be required to
transmit a signal to the dispatch center. Notwithstanding the requirements of this section, when the
fire marshal makes a written determination that the public health, safety and welfare and the lives
and property of individuals will be adequately safeguarded, based on factors such as number of
sprinkler heads or size of the protected area, if no electronically supervised fire alarm control panel
system is installed, then no such system shall be required.

(Ord. No. $6-0-01, 2, [-10-96)
Sec, 6-408, Maintenance.

Every automatic fire sprinkler system installed within the village, whether or not such system is
required by this division, shall be maintained according to the requirements of NFPA 25.

(Ord. No. 96-0-01, 72, 1-10-96)

Sec. 6-409. Sprinkler Control Rooms. In all new construction, and in all existing buildings
where in the opinion of the Director of Fire Prevention states it may be instatled, a sprinkler
control room with an exterior entrance shalt be installed. The control room shall contain the fire
sprinkler risers, and the fire alarm control panel. The room shall face either the main parking lot or
shall face the front street and shall have a hard surface to the entrance door. The Knox key box
shall also be located at the door to the fire sprinkler control room. If the location of the riser and
alarm pane! shall be in a different location due to a remodel then this shall be approved by the
Director of Fire Prevention,

Sec, 6-410. Residential Sprinkler System,



(1) Where Required. Sprinkler protection will be provided within the garage where the
garage is attached to the structure.

(2) Monitoring. A horn/strobe or a bell/strobe will be required on the exterior of the
structure at the garage. This will be activated by the sprinkler flow switch.



